MARINE ENGINEERING AND RESEARCH INSTITUTE MESS
INDIAN MARITIME UNIVERSITY - KOLKATA CAMPUS
P-19, Taratala Road, Kolkata - 700 088
Tender Notice No. IMU/KC/MERI/MESS/2031/24 Dated 10.04.2024 Last Date of Submission 24.04.2024
Rates Valid from : 01st May 2024 to 31st July 2024

COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF Non Veg. Items

Singh Metro Cash & | ..
l\?cly Non Veg Items Chicken [Carry India ;Irno%rr:ﬁs :r?':gfrrise 0] L1 Firm Name
: Shop Pvt. Ltd. P 0

1 |Egg - white (Min. Weight-60 gms) 6.00 - 4.84 5.29 - - 4.84 |Singh & Brothers
Dressed Chicken (Without skin, liver, grizzard, neck,
wings and legs cut up to knee & without dipping in i i i . .

2 TR, R A e sl sl G S 189.00 192.00 245.00 189.00 |Singh Chicken Shop
700 gms.) (60 gm per pc)

3 |Fish - Rohu without Heads & Tail (Cleaned & cutinto | 564 4 27000 | - 299.00 : - | 265.00 [Singh Chicken Shop
pieces) (75 gm per pc)

g |Fish - Katla without Heads & Tail (Cleaned & cutinto | 44, 4 41000 | - 339.00 : - | 339.00 |Halder Enterprise
pices) (75 gm per pc)
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COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF SNACKS

SI No. Snacks Items Halder Enterprise | Shaw Stores Singh & Brothers Alekos Technologies India Pt. .
Ltd. L1 Firm Name
1 |[Lays (Potato Chips) 4.85 4.65 4.69 4.75 4.65 |Shaw Stores 1
2 Kurkure 4.79 4.62 4.69 - 4.62 |Shaw Stores 2
3 Bhujia (Haldiram) 4.69 4.25 4.39 4.75 4.25 [Shaw Stores 3
4 Mixture (Haldiram) 474 4.25 4.39 4.75 4.25 |Shaw Stores 4
5 Moog Dal (Haldiram) 4.75 4.25 4.39 4.75 4.25 [Shaw Stores 5
6 American Lays 4.85 4.65 4.69 - 4.65 [Shaw Stores 6
7 Khatta Meetha (Haldiram) 4.89 4.60 4.39 4.75 4.39 [Singh & Brothers 7
8 Uncle Chips 4.92 4.70 4.69 - 4.69 |Singh & Brothers 8
9 Puff Corn 4.89 4.60 4.69 - 4.60 [Shaw Stores 9
10 [Peanuts (Lehar) 4.89 4.80 4.39 4.75 4.39 |Singh & Brothers 10
11 |Chocolate (Munch/Park) 4,91 4.80 4.74 - 4.74 [Singh & Brothers 11
12  |Biscuits(Parle Cream) 9.53 4.65 4.69 - 4.65 [Shaw Stores 12
13 Biscuits(Parle Hide & Seek) 4.89 - 9.34 - 4.89 [Halder Enterprise 13
14  [Britania Biscuits (Good day ) 4.85 4.65 4.69 - 4.65 |Shaw Stores 14
15 Britania Biscuits (Little Heart) 4,98 - 4.69 - 4.69 [Singh & Brothers 15
16  [Pastry(Vanila/Butter Scotch flv.) 493 - - - 4.93 [Halder Enterprise 16
17 |Britania Biscuits(50 - 50) 4,92 4.65 4.69 - 4.65 |Shaw Stores 17
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COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF FRUIT JUICE & OTHER SOFT DRINKS

. Halder .
Sl Lo . Singh & . | Alekos technologies .
No. Fruit Juice & Other Soft drinks Brothers Enterpris India Pvt. Ltd. L1 Firm Name
1 |Maaza (200 ml tetra Pkt.) - 19.68 - 19.68 |Halder Enterprise
2 [Tang (500 gm pkt.) - 145.00 - 145.00 (Halder Enterprise
3 |Tropicana (200 ml tetra Pkt.) - 19.85 - 19.85 |Halder Enterprise
4 [Real Tetra Pack ( 200 ml tetra Pkt.) 17.80 19.69 25.00 17.80 |Singh & Brothers
5 [B.Natural (ITC Product) (200 ml. tetra pkt.) 17.90 19.39 17.00 17.00 |Alekos technologies India Pvt. Ltd.
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COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF DAIRY PRODUCTS

Dairy producte items Loknath R. C. Sandeep Halder
SI No. Food Co. | Enterprise | Enterprise | Enterprise 0 0 L1 |Firm Name

1 Milk (500 ml. Pkt.) (Haringhata Cow Milk) - 50.00 - 50.99 0 0] 50.00 [R. C. Enterprise

la [Milk (500 ml. Pkt.) (Haringhata Toned Milk) - - - - 0 0| NoBid [No Bid

1b  |Milk (500 ml. Pkt.) (Bhagirathi Milk) - - - - 0 0[ NoBid [No Bid

2 Metro Dairy Dahi (1 kg Pkt) - 70.00 - 73.49 0 0] 70.00 [R. C. Enterprise

2a  [Mother Dairy Dahi (1 kg Pkt) - - - - 0 0| NoBid [No Bid

3 Paneer (with Cream) 239.00 250.00 - 259.00 0 0| 239.00 [Loknath Food Co.

Metro & Kwality Ice Cream (All Varieties) (1

4 |ltr. Block) (Discount allowed) i ) ) ) 0 0| No Bid |No Bid
4a [Vanilla - - 150.00 339.00 0 0| 150.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4b  |Strawberry - - 150.00 0 0| 150.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4c  |Two- In one - - 150.00 339.00 0 0| 150.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4d  [Chocolate - - 160.00 339.00 0 0| 160.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4e  |Yum Aam - - 160.00 229.00 0 0[ 160.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4f  |Butter Scotch - - 170.00 229.00 0 0f 170.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4g |Kesar Pista - - 250.00 - 0 0| 250.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
4h  [Nolen Gure - - 180.00 - 0 0| 180.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
5 Ice Cream Paper Plate per 1000 pic - - 800.00 - 0 0| 800.00 [Sandeep Enterprise
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COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF BAKERY ITEMS

Sl New sree Halder East Village | Home Pride
No Bakery Items Ramkrishna Enterprise | Bakers LLP Industries ]
' Bakery L1 Firm Name
1 |Bread sliced (400 gms pkt) Brown 28.00 34.49 28.00 23.25 23.25 [Home Pride Industries
2 |Bread sliced (400 gms pkt) White 17.00 30.99 20.35 21.75 17.00 |New Sree Ramkrishna Bakery
3 |Bread sliced (800 gms pack) Brown - 68.95 55.00 45.50 45.50 [Home Pride Industries
4 |Bread sliced (800 gms pack) White - 61.98 55.00 43.50 43.50 [Home Pride Industries
5 Rolla (Pow) Bread Standard size - 8 17.00 32.99 20.35 21.75 17.00 |New Sree Ramkrishna Bakery

pieces per pkt.
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COMPARATIVE STATEMENT FOR L1 OF GROCERY

ATEKOS
Sl AJc unit as Sappers Shubham Singh &  [Pioneer Metro Halder Technologie RDG . Viraat .
No Grocery Items per tender Infotech  [Trading Brothers |Servies Cash & Enterprise s India Pyt Enteerprise Agency L1 Firm Name
’ Pvt. Ltd. |Co. Carry el " |Pvt. Ltd.

1 |Arhar Dal kg - 155.00 153.40 158.00 159.00 167.00 170.00 170.00 - 153.40 Singh & Brothers 1
2 [Moong Dal kg - 114.00 106.00 105.00 113.00 109.49 128.00 132.00 - 105.00 Pioneer Servies 2
3 |Masoor Dal kg 75.00 76.00 73.80 82.00 74.00 89.00 84.00 75.00 - 73.80 Singh & Brothers 3
4 [Chana Dal kg 76.00 79.00 77.40 88.00 77.00 84.99 84.00 78.00 - 76.00 [ Sappers Infotech Pvt. Ltd.[ 4
5 |Urad Dal kg - 134.00 134.00 138.00 125.00 134.49 135.00 145.00 - 125.00 Metro Cash & Carry 5
6 |Green Moong kg - 108.00 104.80 128.00 107.00 109.49 115.00 118.00 - 104.80 Singh & Brothers 6
7 |Rajma kg - 152.00 114.00 128.00 145.00 135.00 160.00 172.00 - 114.00 Singh & Brothers 7
8 |Chana Basen kg 98.00 109.00 114.00 108.00 105.00 123.00 120.00 104.00 - 98.00 | Sappers Infotech Pvt. Ltd.| 8
9 [Sugar kg - 45.00 46.00 45.90 43.50 47.89 47.25 51.00 = 43.50 Metro Cash & Carry | 9
10 |Dalia (500 gm Pkt.) Pkt. - 40.00 36.00 38.00 35.00 77.49 40.00 - - 35.00 | Metro Cash & Carry |10
11 [Salt 1 kg Pkt. 24.00 26.60 24.50 = 22.50 29.49 25.20 21.00 - 21.00 RDG Enteerprise Pvt. [11
12 |Kheer Rice (Gobinda Bhog) kg - 80.00 66.00 68.00 62.00 73.00 82.00 - N 62.00 | Metro Cash & Carry |12
13 |Cooking Soda kg - 55.00 59.00 - 73.40 69.00 80.00 E 2 55.00 | Shubham Trading Co. |13
14 [Araroot kg - 50.00 54.00 55.00 73.00 59.00 58.00 - - 50.00 [ Shubham Trading Co. |14
15 |Utensil Cleaning Powder kg = 71.00 = = = 39.00 = 70.00 = 39.00 Halder Enterprise 15
16 [Kaju (Broken) (174 Size) kg - 490.00 468.00 [ 480.00 650.00 549.00 600.00 784.00 - 468.00 Singh & Brothers |16
17 |Kismis kg - 215.00 204.00 210.00 235.00 199.00 280.00 241.00 - 199.00 Halder Enterprise 17
18 |Chilly Sauce 700 gm bl - 44.00 38.00 44.00 - 44.49 52.00 - 63.00 38.00 Singh & Brothers |18
19 [Garlic Chilly Sauce 700 gm btl. - 55.00 44.01 55.00 - 54.39 73.00 - - 44,01 Singh & Brothers 19
20 [Soya Sauce 700 gm btl. = 48.00 39.80 42.00 = 49.99 54.00 187.00 - 39.80 Singh & Brothers 20
21 |Basmati Rice kg 90.00 | 118.00 95.80 98.00 103.00 99.89 118.00 92.00 - 90.00 [ Sappers Infotech Pvt. Ltd.|21
22 [Soyabean kg 118.00 145.00 123.00 128.00 129.00 139.00 152.00 118.00 - Tie Tie 22
23 |Mixed Pickle kg 140.00 60.00 49.00 250.00 - 79.00 53.00 - 55.00 49.00 Singh & Brothers 23
24 |Custard Powder (1 kg pkt.) 1 kg pkt = 190.00 = = 104.00 349.00 = 88.00 = 88.00 RDG Enteerprise Pvi. [24
25 |Sewai (roasted) kg - 92.00 84.00 - - 64.49 - - - 64.49 Halder Enterprise 25
26 |Kala / Brown Chana kg - 78.00 74.80 98.00 74.00 79.99 70.00 85.00 - 70.00 Alekos Technologies |26
27 |Vinegar 700 ml btl - 32.00 24.00 28.00 - 35.00 36.00 - 49.50 24.00 Singh & Brothers 27
28 |Makhana kg - 110.00 670.00 880.00 - 849.00 850.00 95.20 - 95.20 | RDG Enteerprise Pvi. [28
29 [Bread Crumb Powder kg - 78.00 54.00 52.00 - 63.00 126.00 > - 52.00 Pioneer Servies 29
30 [Kabuli Chana kg - 115.00 | 111.80 | 165.00 135.00 119.89 140.00 - - 111.80 Singh & Brothers  [30
31 [Sooji kg 46.00 51.00 54.00 56.00 44.00 59.89 55.00 46.00 - 44.00 Metro Cash & Carry |31
32 |Powha (Chira) kg - 44.00 54.00 - 55.00 49.00 50.00 78.00 - 44.00 Shubham Trading Co. (32
33 |White Matar kg - 58.00 58.00 78.00 60.00 69.49 75.00 60.00 - Tie Tie 33
34 |Coconut Powder kg - 195.00 244.00 - - 279.00 290.00 - - 195.00 Shubham Trading Co. [34
35 |Papad (Masala) kg - 175.00 144.00 158.00 - 159.00 400.00 - - 144.00 Singh & Brothers |35
36 _[Chowmein kg - 135.00 59.00 - - 59.39 97.00 - - 59.00 Singh & Brothers 36
37 |Badam (Ground Nut) kg = 155.00 125.00 130.00 130.00 119.00 155.00 > s 119.00 Halder Enterprise 37
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ATEK0S
Sl Alc unit as Sappers Shubham Singh & | Pioneer Metro Halder |Technologie RDG . Viraat .
No Grocery Items or tender Infotech | Trading Brothers | Servies Cash & Enterorise | s India Pyt Enteerprise Adenc L1 Firm Name
’ P Pvt. Ltd. Co. Carry P L | Pyt Ltd gency
38 |Coffee (200 gm Pkt) 200 gm pKt. - 215.00 214.00 - - 245.00 - - N 214.00 Singh & Brothers |38
39 [Baking Powder kg - 245.00 214.00 - - 280.00 145.00 - = 145.00 Alekos Technologies |39
40 | Tomato Ketchup Sram i 82.00 1.90 - 0.80 2.09 - - 0.78 0 Viraat Agency |40
41 |Jam 4kg /5 kg Jar - - 336.73 - - 389.00 - - - 336.73 Singh & Brothers 41
42 |Butter 20/15kg c/s 522.00 518.00 - - - 559.00 - - 526.00 518.00 | Shubham Trading Co. (42
43 |Refined Edible Oll 15 kg tin 1,710.00 | 1,720.00 - 1,780.00 [ 1,680.00 1,867.35 - - 1,695.00 [ 1,680.00 Metro Cash & Carry 43
44 |Kewra Water 700 ml. = 28.00 22.00 = = 59.00 = = = 22.00 Singh & Brothers 44
45 |Bhujia kg - 230.00 124.00 2 2 115.00 = = 2 115.00 Halder Enterprise 45
46 [Fine food Mineket Rice kg 47.00 57.00 47.40 48.00 45.40 47.29 45.00 - - 45.00 Alekos Technologies (46
47 |Atta kg 33.00 31.50 32.00 31.80 30.00 44.49 44.50 - - 30.00 Metro Cash & Carry (47
48 [Maida kg 33.00 31.50 31.00 31.80 29.00 44.89 48.00 - - 29.00 Metro Cash & Carry (48
49 [Ghee 1 kg Pkt 585.00 - - 680.00 577.85 679.00 748.00 - 595.00 577.85 Metro Cash & Carry (49
50 |Tomato Sauce 1 Kg Pouch. 96.12 82.00 85.00 80.00 93.40 76.00 73.00 68.00 - 68.00 RDG Enteerprise Pvt. |50
51 |Amul Cream 1 Itr. Pkt. - 204.60 - - - 249.00 210.00 - - 204.60 | Shubham Trading Co. (51
52 |Ready Gravey (Brown / White) 1 kg. Pkt. ) ) ) ) ) 179.00 ) 228.00 ) 179.00 Halder Enterprise 52
53 [Rose Water 700 ml. - 28.00 24.00 - - 59.00 - - - 24.00 Singh & Brothers 53
54 |Rice Powder kg - 88.00 48.90 48.00 78.00 48.49 84.00 - - 48.00 Pioneer Servies 54
55 |Urad Dal Powder kg - 210.00 - 100.00 - 145.00 - - - 100.00 Pioneer Servies 55
56 |Washing Soda kg = 72.00 47.00 = = 53.99 = = - 47.00 Singh & Brothers 56
. Pkt. of 100
57 |Gulab Jamun Mix qm. i i 230.00 i i 168.00 i i i 168.00 Halder Enterprise |57
Alekos Technologies
58 Sattu (500 gm pkt.) kg - 170.00 140.00 148.00 144.00 150.00 78.00 128.00 - 78.00 India Pvt. Ltd. 58
59 |Scotch Brite (9.5 cm X 14 cm) kg - - 9.70 28.00 - 9.90 - - - 9.70 Singh & Brothers 59
60 |Pasta (1 kg pkt.) kg. - 220.00 84.00 90.00 - 1,949.00 - - - 84.00 Singh & Brothers 60
1 ([Black Pepper (Golki Whole) kg - 730.00 760.00 780.00 900.00 739.00 - - - 730.00 | Shubham Trading Co. (61
RS TTIMETETPTTSTE F VL.

2 |Black Pepper Powder 100 gm Pkt - 129.20 105.00 110.00 - 75.00 - 62.25 118.00 62.25 Ltd. 62
3 |Chilly Powder kg - 512.00 405.00 420.00 - 439.00 - 400.00 466.00 400.00 | RDG Enteerprise Pvt. (63
4 |Haldi Powder kg - 336.00 218.00 240.00 - 269.00 - 220.00 326.00 218.00 Singh & Brothers 64
5 |Dhania Powder kg - 320.00 214.00 278.00 - 299.00 - 250.00 295.00 214.00 Singh & Brothers 65
6 |Jeera Powder kg - 1,080.00 518.00 660.00 - 739.00 - 630.00 443.00 443.00 Viraat Agency 66
7 |Small Cardamom (Elachi) kg - 1,950.00 [ 1,980.00 | 2,200.00 [ 1,900.00 1,999.00 - - - 1,900.00 Metro Cash & Carry (67
8 |Big Cardamom (Elachi) kg - 1,340.00 | 1,400.00 - - 1,799.00 - - - 1,340.00 | Shubham Trading Co. |68
9 |Jeera (Gota) kg - 315.00 304.00 480.00 390.00 715.00 - 550.00 - 304.00 Singh & Brothers 69
10 |Dry Chilly kg - 295.00 298.00 360.00 325.00 339.00 - - - 295.00 | Shubham Trading Co. (70
11 [Cloves (Lawang) kg - 1,090.00 [ 1,200.00 [ 1,180.00 - 1,049.00 - - - 1,049.00 Halder Enterprise 71
12 |Gota Garam Masala kg - 1,650.00 [ 1,080.00 | 1,180.00 [ 1,200.00 1,699.00 - - - 1,080.00 Singh & Brothers 72
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Alekos
Sl A/c unit as Sappers Shubham Singh & | Pioneer Metro Halder |Technologie RDG . Viraat .
No. Grocery Items per tender Infotech | Trading Brothers | Servies Cash & Enterprise | s India Pvt. Enteerprise Agency L1 Firm Name
Pvt. Ltd. Co. Carry Ltd Pvt. Ltd.

13 |Magaj kg - 730.00 658.00 840.00 900.00 729.00 - = = 658.00 Singh & Brothers 73
14 [Cinamon (Dalchini) kg - 320.00 300.00 380.00 315.00 349.00 - - = 300.00 Singh & Brothers 74
15 |Tej Patta kg - 80.00 98.00 - - 95.00 - - - 80.00 | Shubham Trading Co. (75
16 |Panchfuran kg - 170.00 280.00 - 200.00 249.00 - 340.00 - 170.00 | Shubham Trading Co. |76
17 [Hing kg - 1,008.00 850.00 - - 749.00 - 1,500.00 | 2,130.00 749.00 Halder Enterprise 77
18 [Jaifal pc - 9.00 8.00 = = 8.00 - - - Tie Tie 78
19 (Jaitri kg - 2,150.00 | 1,908.00 = = 2,949.00 = - - 1,908.00 Singh & Brothers 79
20 |Dry Gulab Phool kg - 720.00 450.00 - - 689.00 - - - 450.00 Singh & Brothers 80
21 |Kashmirt Mirch Powder 100 gm pkt. - 102.00 104.00 107.00 - 95.00 2 100.80 93.25 93.25 Viraat Agency 81
22 |Edible Colour 100 gm PkKt. - 68.00 74.00 - - 105.00 - - - 68.00 | Shubham Trading Co. |82
23 |Ajwain kg = 310.00 290.00 - - 289.00 - 392.00 - 289.00 Halder Enterprise 83
24 |Posto kg - 1,240.00 [ 1,160.00 | 1,340.00 - 2,199.00 - 1,550.00 - 1,160.00 Singh & Brothers 84
25 [Sambar Masala 100 gm pkt. - 74.80 68.00 70.00 - 85.00 - 84.00 62.00 62.00 Viraat Agency 85
26 |Paw Bhagi Masala 100 gm pkt. - 74.80 78.00 70.00 - 93.00 - - 70.00 Tie Tie 86
27 |Kasturi Methi 100 gm pkt. - 86.70 89.00 90.00 - 95.00 - 83.20 79.25 79.25 Viraat Agency 87
28 |Chana Masala 100 gm pkt. - 72.25 82.00 70.00 = 92.00 = 67.50 68.00 67.50 | RDG Enteerprise Pvt. |88
29 |Chat Masala 100 gm pkt. - 73.95 82.00 75.00 - 89.00 - 66.00 66.00 Tie Tie 89
30 |Sabji Masala 100 gm pkt. - 80.00 - 60.00 - 85.00 - 58.50 56.00 56.00 Viraat Agency 90
31 [Kalo Jeera kg = 310.00 340.00 280.00 - 269.00 - 390.00 - 269.00 Halder Enterprise 91
32 [Biryani Masala (50g) 50 gm Pkt. - 110.00 74.00 70.00 - 83.00 - 60.00 64.50 60.00 RDG Enteerprise Pvt. (92
33 [Sarisha (Black) kg - 95.00 84.00 120.00 - 85.00 - 145.00 - 84.00 Singh & Brothers 93
34 [Amchur Powder 100 gm pkt. - 79.90 340.00 50.00 - 40.00 - 80.00 74.60 40.00 Halder Enterprise 94
35 |Methi Seed kg - 120.00 112.00 - - 289.00 - 170.00 - 112.00 Singh & Brothers 95
36 [Sauff (Mouri) kg - 160.00 180.00 - - 285.00 - 510.00 - 160.00 [ Shubham Trading Co. |96
37 |pkt.) 100 gm pkt. - 80.00 - - - 49.00 - 58.50 56.00 49.00 Halder Enterprise 97
38 |Meat Masala (100 gm pkt.) 100 gm pkt. - 83.30 - 75.00 - 95.00 = 73.50 71.50 71.50 Viraat Agency 98
39 |Mitha Attar 12 ml - 38.00 24.00 35.00 40.00 49.00 - - - 24.00 Singh & Brothers 99




